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May 10, 2014 
 

ECI TEE TIMES ANNOUNCED; MICELI WITHDRAWS 
 

SOUTH WINDSOR, Conn. – Tournament officials at the 12-year-old annual alumni 
event that pits hard-working amateurs against the post-college casual golfer has at long 
last, finalized its starting times with Shining Rock Golf Club, its new venue. 
 
With a field of 12 at the most, it may seem depleted, but there certainly isn’t a lack of 
talent, and it’s definitely an outing the players look forward to every spring. “We have 
four out of the five champions of this tournament, playing this year, “stated Marc Zirolli, 
ECI tournament co-chair. “We hope Mr. Gill can attend, but at the same time, we 
understand his commitment with work. He is well aware that there is always a place for 
him at the ECI.” 
 
The first starting time is at 10:30 a.m., with the subsequent times eight minutes apart, at 
10:38 and 10:47. Players have the option the day of the tournament to find a nearby 
driving range, since an onsite facility at Shining Rock does not exist. Please arrive at the 
golf course an hour in advance to allow proper catching up with old friends and to offer 
well wishes to the Montréal Canadiens as their pursuit to bring the Cup home where it 
belongs, continues into the Eastern Conference Finals. 
 
JERRY MICELI SITES UNDISCLOSED WD 
 
Jerry Miceli, the ECI’s youngest star, withdrew from tournament competition on 
Wednesday, May 7, but not without displaying a clear sign of disappointment. “I’m really 
upset that I won’t be able to compete at this year’s event,” stated Miceli, who finished 
ninth in 2013. “I always look forward to playing, and feel that I can compete each and 
every year. Hey; some things come up; it happens, and I’m sure Marc, John and the rest 
of the guys understand. I’m already gearing up for a return in 2015!” 
 
In three starts at the ECI, Miceli’s best finish was tied for third in 2011 with Nick 
Turczak. John Dailey captured his most recent ECI title that year, finishing two better 
than Ken Tessier, and three ahead of Miceli and Turczak. After withdrawing in 2013, 
Dailey returns this year, seeking a tournament-best, fourth championship. 


